
MAHONING TOWNSHIP BOARD OF SUPERVISOR’S MEETING

Monday, April 26, 2010


CALL TO ORDER:

John Wieczorek called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. at the Mahoning Township Building, 2685 Mahoning Drive East, Lehighton, PA 18235

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE:

John Wieczorek led the Pledge of Allegiance.  
ROLL CALL:

PRESENT:

John Wieczorek, Chairman; George Stawnyczyj, Supervisor; Linda Benner, Supervisor; Thomas Nanovic, Solicitor and Natalie D. Haggerty, Secretary-Treasurer
ABSENT:
Travis Steigerwalt, Vice-Chairman and Franklin Ruch, Supervisor
QUESTIONS ON OR ADDITIONS TO THE AGENDA:

None
PUBLIC COMMENT:

Russ Pearson-met with Chief Barnes and Officer Long regarding unregistered junk vehicles at 133 Flagstaff Road property.  A certified letter was sent advising to clean up or he will be brought before the magistrate and possibly fined. Questioned how far a neighboring property must stay away with regards to the issue of Mr. Claypool pushing fill over the property stakes.  John Wieczorek will investigate. 

Jeremy Jones, General Manager of Mahoning Valley Country Club requesting a letter from the township granting permission to operate a restaurant in an R-1 Zoning District.  He was advised to file an application and go before the Zoning Hearing Board because a restaurant is not a permitted use in an R-1 Zoning District. 
OPENING OF BIDS FOR ROAD MATERIALS

	
	
	
	
	LEHIGH ASPHALT
	EASTERN INDUSTRIES

	ITEM NO.
	QTY
	UNIT
	DESCRIPTION 
	F.O.B.
	DEL.
	F.O.B.


	DEL

	#1


	500
	TON
	9.5 mm Wearing Course
	$56.00
$28,000.00
	
	$56.00 Ormrod

$28,000.00
	

	#1-A


	1800
	TON
	9.5 mm Wearing Course
	
	$61.00
$109,800.00

	
	$70.00/hr

	#2


	500
	TON
	25 mm Base Course
	$47.00
$23,500.00
	
	$48.00

$24,000.00
	

	#2-A


	500
	TON
	25 mm Base Course
	
	$52.00
$26,000.00
	
	$70.00/hr

	#3


	500
	TON
	#8 W/2% Loss by wash
	
	$14.50

$7,250.00
	$12.00 Ormrod 

$6,000.00
	$18.31

$9,155.00

	#4


	1500
	TON
	Type 2 Anit-Skid
	
	$13.25
$19,875.00
	$7.50 Ormrod

$11,250.00
	$13.81

$20,715.00

	#5


	500
	TON
	2-A
	$8.00
$4,000.00
	
	$6.95 Whitehall

$3,475.00
	

	#5-A
	500
	TON
	2-A
	
	$11.50

$5,750.00
	
	$13.26

$6,630.00

	#6
	500
	TON
	#3
	$9.50

$4,750.00
	
	$8.00 Ormrod
$4,000.00
	

	#6-A
	500
	TON
	#3
	
	$13.00
$6,500.00
	
	$14.31

$7,155.00

	#7
	500
	TON
	#1 STONE
	$9.50

$4,750.00
	
	$8.00 Ormrod

$4,000.00
	

	#7-A
	500
	TON
	#1 STONE
	
	$13.00

$6,500.00
	
	$14.31

$7,155.00

	#8
	500
	TON
	#3A MODIFIED
	NO BID


	NO BID


	NO BID
	

	#8-A
	500
	TON
	#3A MODIFIED
	NO BID
	NO BID


	
	NO BID

	#9
	500
	TON
	#57
	
	$13.50

$6,750.00
	$9.00 Ormrod

$4,500.00
	$15.36

$7680.00

	Note:
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	HAZLETON MATERIALS
	HANSON
	ECKLEY

	ITEM NO.
	QTY
	UNIT
	DESCRIPTION 
	FOB
	DEL

	FOB
	DEL.
	F.O.B.


	DEL.

	#1


	500
	TON
	9.5 mm Wearing Course
	NO BID
	
	$55.40

$27,700.00
	
	$58.99
$29495.00
	

	#1-A


	1800
	TON
	9.5 mm Wearing Course
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	$66.99
$33495.00

	#2


	500
	TON
	25 mm Base Course
	NO BID
	
	$48.10

$24,050.00
	
	$49.49
$24745.00
	

	#2-A


	500
	TON
	25 mm Base Course
	NO BID 
	
	
	
	
	$57.49
$28745.00

	#3


	500
	TON
	#8 W/2% Loss by wash
	
	$18.00

$9,000.00
	
	$17.25
$8,625.00
	NO BID
	

	#4


	1500
	TON
	Type 2 Anti-Skid
	
	$16.50
$24750.00
	
	$17.00

$25,500.00
	
	NO BID

	#5


	500
	TON
	2-A
	$5.65
$2825.00
	
	$7.25

$3,625.00
	
	NO BID
	

	#5-A
	500
	TON
	2-A
	
	$12.65
$6,325.00
	
	$14.00 

$7,000.00
	
	NO BID

	#6
	500
	TON
	#3
	$6.74
$3370.00
	
	$8.75

$4,375.00
	
	NO BID
	

	#6-A
	500
	TON
	#3
	
	$13.74
$6,870.00
	
	$15.50

$7,750.00
	
	NO BID

	#7
	500
	TON
	#1 STONE
	$6.74
$3370.00
	
	$8.75
$4,375.00
	
	NO BID
	

	#7-A
	500
	TON
	#1 STONE
	
	$13.74
$6,870.00
	
	$15.50

$7,750.00
	
	NO BID

	#8
	500
	TON
	#3A MODIFIED
	$6.10
$3050.00
	
	$8.75
$4,375.00
	
	NO B ID
	

	#8-A
	500
	TON
	#3A MODIFIED
	
	$13.10
$6,550.00
	
	$15.50

$7,750.00
	
	NO BID

	#9
	500
	TON
	#57
	
	$14.00
$7,000.00
	
	$15.75
$7,875.00
	
	NO BID

	Note:
	
	
	
	
	
	Quarry-

Stroudsburg
	
	
	


OPENING OF BIDS FOR GASOLINE, DIESEL, HEATING FUEL

	
	
	
	
	FARM & HOME OIL 

	ITEM NO.
	APPROX. QUANTITY
	UNIT
	DESCRIPTION 
	DELIVERED

	#1
	8500
	GALS
	Lead free gas delivered to the

Township tank as needed for one year.
89 Octane
	$2.6010

$22,108.50

	#2
	3000
	GALS
	#2 Heating Fuel delivered to 

Township Tank as needed for one year.
	$2.4680

$7,404.00

	#3
	5500
	GALS
	Low Sulfur Diesel delivered to the 

Township tank as needed for one year.


	$2.6140

$14,377.00


APPROVAL OF MINUTES:

MOTION

John Wieczorek made a motion to approve the minutes of the April 12, 2010 Board of Supervisors Meeting.  Seconded by Linda Benner. John Wieczorek, yes; George Stawnyczyj, yes and Linda Benner, yes. 3-0 vote. Motion carried.
OLD BUSINESS:

Escrow Accounts for Professional Fees to be Paid When a Subdivision or Land Development is Filed

MOTION

George Stawnyczyj made a motion to table.  Seconded by John Wieczorek.  John Wieczorek, yes; George Stawnyczyj, yes and Linda Benner, yes. 3-0 vote. Motion carried.

Part Time Summer Help for the Road Department

MOTION 

John Wieczorek made a motion to bring on Joe McGinley part time road department worker with a CDL as summer help road worker conditioned upon an as need basis per the road departments schedule  at $13.00/hr and advertise for one part time summer helper at a rate of $9.00/hr.  Seconded by Linda Benner.  John Wieczorek, yes; George Stawnyczyj, yes and Linda Benner, yes. 3-0 vote. Motion carried.

NEW BUSINESS:

Grant Retail Center 

Carl Faust was present to advise the Board that no occupancy permit was issued because Grant Retail Center as Built Plan was never approved by the Board.  Tabled to give time for Attorney Nanovic and new board members to review.
Walmart Supercenter Land Use Letter

MOTION

George Stawnyczyj made a motion to complete the Walmart Supercenter Municipal Land Use Letter. Seconded by John Wieczorek.  John Wieczorek, yes; George Stawnyczyj, yes and Linda Benner, yes. 3-0 vote. Motion carried.

Packerton Yards Business Park (plan date of February 2, 2010) Extension Request to September 30, 2010

MOTION

John Wieczorek made a motion to grant Packerton Yards Business Park (plan date of February 2, 2010) an extension to September 30, 2010.  Seconded by George Stawnyczyj.   John Wieczorek, yes; George Stawnyczyj, yes and Linda Benner, yes. 3-0 vote. Motion carried.

CORRESPONDENCE:

Linda Benner made a motion to approve and place on file correspondence dated April 26, 2010. Seconded John Wieczorek.  John Wieczorek, yes; George Stawnyczyj, yes and Linda Benner, yes.  3-0 vote. Motion carried. 
***COUNTY EMA

RE: EMAIL 2010 NIMS TRAINING REQUIREMENTS, ATTACHING A FIVE-YEAR TRAINING PLAN

***CARBON ENGINEERING, GREGORY S. HAAS, P.E.

RE: PACKERTON BUSINESS PARK MAJOR SUBDIVISION, ADVISING THAT THE CARBON COUNTY COMMISSIONERS ARE APPLYING FOR CHAPTER 105 GENERAL PERMITS FROM DEP 

***MAHONING TOWNSHIP ZONING OFFICER, LEROY LEIBENGUTH

RE: MICHAEL AND MARY FISHER DENIAL LETTER TO OPERATE A HAMBURGER SHOP NOT A PERMITTED USE IN AN R-2 ZONING DISTRICT

***T & M ASSOCIATES, GARY DAHMS, P.E.

RE: TIMOTHY EDINGER HAS ACCEPTED A POSITION WITH T & M ASSOCIATES AS A RESULT OF THE RECENT CLOSING OF CMX

*** PENNSYLVANIA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

RE: INTEGRATING TRANSPORTATION AND LAND USE INTO COMPREHENSIVE PLANS

***PENNSYLVANIA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION, SCOTT T. CONFER, WATER QUALITY SPECIALIST

RE: COPY OF LETTER SENT TO CENTRAL CARBON MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY ADVISING OF NOTICE OF VIOLATION

***PENN FOREST TOWNSHIP, ALAN KATZ 

RE: EMAIL-REMOVAL OF CURRENT OFFICERS

***PENN FOREST TOWNSHIP, ALAN KATZ

RE: EMAIL-PRESS RELEASE 

***PENN FOREST TOWNSHIP, ALAN KATZ

RE: EMAIL- RESPONSE TO DAVE WARGO’S ARTICLE 

***PENN FOREST TOWNSHIP, ALAN KATZ

RE: EMAIL –ASSAULT FROM TRAVIS STEIGERWALT

***NANOVIC LAW OFFICES, THOMAS NANOVIC

RE: COPY OF LETTER SENT TO THE CARBON COUNTY COMMISSIONERS REGARDING PACKERTON BUSINESS PARK REQUESTING A NEW LAND DEVELOPMENT APPLICATION BE SUBMITTED FOR THE MOST RECENT SUBMISSION, AGREED TO WAIVE FILING FEES UPON RECOMMENDATION OF THE  MAHONING TOWNSHIP PLANNING COMMISSION TO THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

***NANOVIC LAW OFFICES, THOMAS NANOVIC

RE: INFORMATION REGARDING EARNED INCOME TAXES

**NANOVIC LAW OFFICES, THOMAS NANOVIC

RE: POLICE TENURE ACT

***VELITSKY & MATIKA LAW OFFICE, JOSEPH MATIKA

RE: ADVISING HE REPRESENTS MR. PEARSON REGARDING NUISANCE PROPERTY OF MR. CLAYPOOLE 216 BEAVER RUN DRIVE

***GANNETT FLEMING, ERIC NEAST, P.E.

RE: PA TURNPIKE COMMISSION PROJECT, REPLACEMENT OF BRIDGES MODIFICATION FOR NPDES PERMIT 

***CARBON COUNTY CONSERVATION DISTRICT 

RE: EROSION CONTROL PLAN REVIEW OF THE PA TURNPIKE BRIDGE REPLACEMENT PROJECTS 

***PENN FOREST TOWNSHIP

RE: HOUSE BILL 2412

***MAHONING TOWNSHIP PLANNING COMMISSION, PATRICIA L. SNYDER, SECRETARY

RE: ACTION TAKEN AT THE APRIL 20, 2010 PLANNING COMMISSION MEETING

***NANOVIC LAW OFFICE, THOMAS NANOVIC

RE: COPY OF A LETTER SENT TO KIRK, SUMMA & CO. LLP RESPONSE LETTER

***PENNSYLVANIA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, JOSEPH J. RAUSCHER, PE

RE: RTE 209 SPEED LIMIT POSTING 

***PSATS NEWS BULLETIN, APRIL 2010

***DELAWARE RIVER BASIN COMMISSION

RE: NOTICE OF APPLICATIONS RECEIVED BY THE DELAWARE RIVER BASIN COMMISSION

Comment: Question of whether the plant is located in Mahoning or East Penn Township.  Send a letter to Nis Hollow estates and cc DRBC. 
OFFICIALS:

George Stawnyczyj

· EMC requirement of a State Police Criminal Background Check has come back to the township clear.
· Attended a seminar hosted by the County Planning Commission.  LED conversion grant is 100% funded

John Wieczorek

· Blue Cross insurance rates are down
· Tax Collection Committee is processing requests for proposals

· Had conversation with Bobby Miller with regards to the packet received by all from Ryan Bowman
· Grant monies available for Pennsylvanians offering rebate monies for installing energy saving improvements to their homes.
Thomas Nanovic

· Request an executive session with regards to the Vandling matter and other business. 

ADJOURNMENT:
MOTION

Linda Benner made a motion to adjourn the meeting at 8:30 PM.  Seconded by George Stawnyczyj. John Wieczorek, yes; George Stawnyczyj, yes and Linda Benner, yes. 3-0 vote. Motion carried.
Respectfully Submitted,

Natalie D. Haggerty










Secretary-Treasurer
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